
ELEVENTH DECLARATION OF DISASTER

(COVID-19)

WIlHRliAS. llic novel coronavirus (COVID-19) outbreak has been recognized as
a pandemic by the World Health Organizaiion and is a contagious respiratory
virus; and

WHEREAS, on March 13. 2020, pursuant to Section 418.014 of the Texas
Government Code, the Governor declared a state of disaster for the State of Texas;
and

WHEREAS, on March 13. 2020. Lubbock County, Texas declared a slate of
disaster; and

WllERliAS, on March 16.2020, the Mayor issued the first of several Declarations
of Disaster; and

WHHRliAS. the City olT-ubbock has taken numerous steps to respond to COVID-
19. and has coordinated preparedness and response efforts across state and local
agencies, and worked with local partners to promote appropriate mitigation efforts;
and

WllERl'AS. it is critical for the City of l.ubbock respond to, and mitigate, the
spread of COVID-19 to protect the health and welfare olThe citizens of Lubbock
and the surrounding area; and

WHERliAS, declaring and continuing a stale ol' disaster will facilitate and
expedite the use and deployment of resources to enhance preparedness and
response; and

WHEREAS, on April 27. 2020. the Governor announced Phase 1 of the plan to
reopen Texas, accompanied by Texans Helping Texans: The Governor's Report to
Open Texas, a detailed report, available on the Governor's Strike Force to Open
'Texas website, intended to help Texans understand Phase I by outlining the new
protocols, guidance, and recommendations; and

WHEREAS, on May 18. 2020. the Governor announced Phase 11 of the ongoing
plan to open additional businesses and activities in Texas, expanding upon the
businesses and activities included in the first phase of the plan to Open Texas while
minimizing the spread of COVID-19. All newly opened businesses and services
are subject to the recommended minimum standard health protocols outlined by
DSllS: and

WHEREAS, while local officials may enforce the governor's executive orders as
well as local restrictions which are consistent with the executive orders, primary














